
Wireless Internet Access Policy 
 

The library provides free, unsecured, wireless Internet access for public use, but cannot 
guarantee uninterrupted service. 
 
Those who would like to access the Internet via our wireless network must have their own 
personal mobile devices, which are equipped with a wireless card and set to obtain an IP 
address automatically, with no proxy server settings.  
 
Library staff is able to provide only limited technical assistance and may not be able to 
troubleshoot connection problems. 
 
The library assumes no responsibility for patron equipment or software and cannot guarantee 
the security of files or transmissions.  
 
The library upholds the rights and responsibility of parents and legal guardians to guide, 
determine, and monitor their children’s use of the library’s network. As with other library 
materials, monitoring of a child’s access to the Internet is the responsibility of the parent or 
legal guardian. The Library is not responsible for enforcing any restrictions which a parent or 
guardian may place on a minor's use of this resource. 
 
The range of the wireless network covers the entire library. Patrons are not restricted as to 
where (within the library) they may chose to use a personal mobile device, and will be asked 
to move only if they are causing a disturbance or are interfering with library programming.  
 
The library does not provide access to our network printer for those using a personal mobile 
device, nor do we provide any physical connectivity other than an electrical outlet, when 
available. Patrons are not permitted to unplug any library equipment in order to plug in their 
personal equipment.  
 
Please note that although the portions of the library’s Public Access Internet Policy concerning 
library equipment do not apply to personal mobile device users, all ethical considerations do 
apply. A copy of this policy is available for viewing at the Circulation Desk. Wireless Internet 
access may not be used for unauthorized, illegal or unethical purposes. No one may send, 
receive, or display text or graphics that may reasonably be construed as obscene or violent. If 
caught purposely browsing an obscene or violent site, individuals must immediately close the 
Internet connection and leave the library. 
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